
AGENDA 
BUILDINGS & GROUNDS COMMITTEE MEETING 

TUESDAY, JANUARY 20, 2026 
7:00 P.M. 

1. ROLL CALL

2. APPROVAL OF AGENDA
Motion to approve the agenda as presented. 

3. APPROVAL OF COMMITTEE MINUTES
• NOVEMBER 18, 2025

Motion to approve the minutes of the November 18, 2025 meeting as presented.

4. COMMENTS FROM THE AUDIENCE

5. OLD BUSINESS

6. NEW BUSINESS

A. 2026 Asphalt Repairs, Sealcoating and Striping / M26-001
Motion to recommend to the full board to award the asphalt repairs, crack filling and 
sealcoating bid project to Schroeder Asphalt Services, Inc. for a total of $208,307.45 plus 
a 5% contingency for a total of $218,722.83. 

B. 2026 Court Repairs and Color Coating at Multiple Locations / M26-003
Motion to recommend to the full board to award the bid for 2026 Court Repairs and 
Color Coating to Sport Surface Pros for a total of $83,000 plus a $3,000 contingency for 
a total of $86,000.. 

C. Mowing Services 2026-2028 / M26-002
Motion to recommend to the full board to award the mowing services bid to Gilio 
Landscapes for $120,260.00 in 2026 and, if extended, $122,665.20 in 2027 and 
$125,118.51 in 2028. 

D. Mower Purchase / M26-004
Motion to recommend to the full board to approve the purchase of a Ventrac Tractor with 
tough cut and boom mower attachments from Burris Equipment for a total of $59,782.41. 

E. Parks, Planning & Maintenance Board Report / M26-005
Motion to recommend to the full board to include the Parks, Planning & Maintenance 
January Board Report in the January Executive Director’s Report. 

7. COMMITTEE MEMBER COMMENTS

8. ADJOURNMENT
Motion to adjourn the meeting. 



 
 

 
 

MINUTES 
BUILDINGS & GROUNDS COMMITTEE MEETING 

October 18, 2025 
 

1. Roll Call: 
 

A regular meeting of the Hoffman Estates Park District Buildings & Grounds Committee was 
held on October 18, 2025, at 7:03 p.m. at Triphahn Center in Hoffman Estates, IL. 

 
Present: Chairman Chhatwani, Commissioner Evans, Comm Reps Kratohvil, 

Pilafas, Poeschel and Sernett 
 
 Absent:  Comm Rep Dowling 
 

Also Present: Executive Director Talsma, Director of Parks, Planning and 
Maintenance Hugen, Deputy Director Bechtold, Director of Recreation 
Sweeney, Director of Administrative Services Rivas, Executive 
Assistant Flynn 

 
Audience: President Friedman, Commissioners Dressler, Kaplan, McGinn, and 

MacGregor, Comm Reps Aguilar, P. Henderson, Kulkarni 
 
2. Approval of Agenda: 
 

Executive Director Talsma stated that we would be presenting the IAPD Citizen Volunteer of 
the Year Award to Dave Negrete before Comments from the Audience. 
Commissioner Evans made a motion, seconded by Comm Rep Poeschel to approve the 
agenda as amended. The motion carried by voice vote. 
 

3.  Approval of the Minutes: 
 

Comm Rep Sernett made a motion, seconded by Comm Rep Kratohvil to approve the 
minutes of the October 21, 2025 meeting as presented. The motion carried by voice vote.  
 

4. Comments from the Audience: 
 
 None 
 
5. Old Business: 
 
 None 
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6. New Business: 
 

A. Solar Panel Purchase and Installation / M25-108 
 
Commissioner Evans made a motion, seconded by Comm Rep Poeschel to approve the 
purchase and installation of solar panels from Verde Solutions via TIPS Cooperative contract 
$25020102, with a down payment of 20% for The Club in the amount of $367,449; 10% for 
Triphahn Center (TC) in the amount of $204,452, and 10% for Willow Rec Center (WRC) in 
the amount of $37,946. 
 
Executive 
 
The motion carried by voice vote. 
 
B. Lightning Detection System / M25-096 

 
Comm Rep Dowling made a motion, seconded by Comm Rep Poeschel to recommend to the 
full board to approve that lightning detection services only be used at Seascape Family 
Aquatic Center and Bridges of Poplar Creek Country Club. 
 
Executive Director Talsma explained that this approval is just for the concept of having 
lightning detection services at only these two locations. We currently have a Thorguard 
detection system, which was the new technology when we first installed it but is now 
outdated. Over the years, the cost has escalated, and it would cost approximately $200,000 to 
replace all locations. 
 
Director Hugen added that the current Thorguard system has one main system and remote 
systems. We spend 100-120 hours of main labor per year to keep these up and running. With 
the new system, Bridges would be the main station with its own built-in weather station, 
rather than pulling weather from O’Hare like our current system. We can have a certain 
number of users with access to an app to pull the weather from our station. Also, the weather 
station can show current weather on our website, and any coach or resident can see this at 
any time. 
 
There was discussion about having a station in other areas of town. Director Hugen added 
that Perry Weather (potential vendor) recommends having a station at facilities where you 
can control what patrons are going to do (golf course and swimming pool). We do not 
necessarily have staff at other parks, so individuals are expected to use the park at their own 
risk regardless of the detection systems. 
 
 
 
 
C. Parks, Planning & Maintenance Board Report and 3rd Quarter Goals / M25-095 
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Comm Rep Poeschel made a motion, seconded by Comm Rep Dowling, to include the Parks, 
Planning & Maintenance October Board Report and 3rd Quarter Goals in the October 
Executive Director’s Report. 
 
Director Hugen recommended that the committee members go see the new renovations at 
Willow Rec Center. The whole facility has a new vibe and there is a new front entrance as 
well. 
 
Executive Director Talsma added that Director Hugen and his crew did a lot of the work over 
at Willow. The fitness center is now a full center. There are new sound panels on the walls. 
There is now one price to use either the Willow or Triphahn Fitness Center. The gymnastics 
area is phenomenal. 
 
The motion carried by voice vote. 
 
D. 2026-2030 Capital Expenditures Plan / M25-090 
 
Comm Rep Sernett made a motion, seconded by Comm Rep Poeschel to recommend to the 
full board the approval of the 2026-2030 Capital Expenditures Plan as presented, with the 
authority to purchase certain items as needed prior to the end of 2025. 
 
Executive Director Talsma said this will be two-phased, as staff often needs to order things 
early (e.g., vehicles, lightning detection, solar panels, Zamboni), and we will have those 
specific memos at the November meeting. These items will not be paid for until 2026 but we 
need to get them on order now, so we receive them in 2026. 
 
Commissioner Dressler said she saw Tropicana Park on the schedule and asked if the tiles 
were still out there and if they would remain. Director Hugen said they are still there, but we 
will not know the plan until we are in the planning phase for that park. He added that we can 
only install a playground if we take away the shelter. 
 
The motion carried by voice vote. 
 
E. Sexual Harassment Training 
 
Director Rival presented the annual Sexual Harassment Training to the Board of the 
Commissioners, as well as the B&G and Rec & Facilities Community Representatives. 

 
7. Comments: 

 
Comm Rep Kratohvil thanked Director Hugen for treating the water at Yorkshire Woods. 
 
Commissioner Evans said he would like to see the cost of having one weather station in all 
three main areas of town (like Cannon Crossing and South Ridge). Director Hugen replied 
that the difference is that right now our sirens will travel up to two miles. New sirens are not 
allowed to go over 1500 feet and may not go into residential areas – this is a nationwide 
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regulation. Commissioner Evans said we would need to do some education for the public if 
we no longer have sirens in the area. 
 
Comm Rep Pilafas said it is good to be back. He lives close to Sycamore, and it has been 
cool to see all that is happening there, as well as all other projects. 
 
Comm Rep Dowling said The Club just celebrated 25 years. It always looks new, the spin 
room is cozy, the massage service is good. She is now a graduate of the citizen public works 
academy. 
 
Commissioner Chhatwani thanked everyone for good discussions today. Congratulations to 
Craig and Sue. Today is Diwali – she wished everyone a happy and prosperous life. 
 

8. Adjournment: 
 

Comm Rep Sernett made a motion, seconded by Comm Rep Pilafas to adjourn the meeting at 
7:52 p.m. The motion carried by voice vote.  
 
 

Respectfully submitted, 
 
Craig Talsma 
Secretary 
 
Cindy Flynn 
Executive Assistant 
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MEMORANDUM M26-001 
 

 
TO:  Building & Grounds Committee 
FROM: Craig Talsma, Executive Director 
  Dustin Hugen, Director of Parks, Planning & Maintenance 
RE: 2026 Asphalt Repairs, Seal Coating and Striping   
DATE: 1/20/2026 
 
Motion:  
 
Recommend to the full board to award the asphalt repairs, crack filling and sealcoating bid 
project to Schroeder Asphalt Services, Inc. for a total of $208,307.45 plus a 5% contingency for 
a total of $218,722.83. 
 
Background: 
 
The board has approved a budget of $305,000 for Asphalt Repairs, which also includes asphalt 
court repairs (outlined in Memo M26-003 for total of $86,000).  
 
Bids were opened on 1/14/2026 for asphalt repairs and seal coating work to be completed at 
multiple locations. This work is part of an ongoing preventative maintenance program with the 
intent of extending the life cycle of the existing parking and drive areas of the district.  
 

Parking Lots  Path Overlay 
Bridges of Poplar Creek Clubhouse & Road  Hunters Ridge Park  
Bridges of Poplar Creek Maintenance  Fabbrini Park  
Canterbury Fields  
Cannon Crossings   
Cottonwood Park    
Olmstead Park    

 
Rationale: 
 
A total of five bids were received. The bid results are below. The low bid is from Schroeder 
Asphalt Services. They completed similar projects last year with Hanover Park District and the 
Village of Arlington Heights and both organizations were very pleased with their work and 
would recommend them.  
 

 
 
  

Denler, Inc. Chicagoland Paving 
Contractors, Inc.

Patriot Maintenance, 
Inc.

Maneval Construction Co. 
Inc.

Schroeder Asphalt Services, 
Inc.

238,263.24$             219,521.32$             211,475.63$               316,871.04$                     208,307.45$                          
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MEMORANDUM M26-003 

TO:   Building and Grounds Committee 
FROM: Craig Talsma, Executive Director 

Dustin Hugen, Director of Parks, Planning & Maintenance  
RE:   2026 Court Repairs & Color Coating at Multiple Locations  
DATE: 1/20/2026  
 
Motion: 
 
Recommend to the full board to award the bid for 2026 Court Repairs and Color Coating to 
Sport Surface Pros for a total of $83,000 plus a $3,000 contingency for a total of $86,000.  
 
Background: 
 
As part of the 2026 Capital Improvement Plan, the board has approved $305,000 in funds for 
asphalt improvements which include paths and parking lots (bid total of $208,307.45, outlined in 
Memo M26-001) and multiple tennis and basketball courts at Olmstead, Willow, Fabbrini, Black 
Bear, Huntington, and Poplar Parks. Bids were opened on 1/14/2025 for this project. 
 
Rationale: 
 

As part of our ongoing maintenance, all courts are repaired every three years. We received four 
bids for this project and Sport Surface Pros LLC was the lowest qualified bidder at $83,000. 
Sports Surface Pros completed our outdoor court repairs in 2022, 2023, 2024 and 2025 and have 
completed all courts in a timely manner with exceptional quality.  

 

 

 

Scope of Work Everline Coatings and 
Services

American Sealcoating of 
Indiana, Inc. 

Sport Surface Pros, LLC Us Tennis Court 
Construction Co. 

Bid Bond X X X

Item 1T: Olmstead Tennis Courts (2) $26,375.00 $19,000.00 $14,000.00 $28,650.00

Item 2T: Willow Recreation Tennis Courts (2) $28,600.00 $19,000.00 $14,000.00 No Bid

Item 3T: Fabbrini Tennis (1) / Pickle Ball Courts (10) $50,000.00 $44,500.00 $28,000.00 No Bid

Tennis Court Repairs Total $104,975.00 $82,500.00 $56,000.00 Incomplete

Item 1B: Olmstead Park Basketball Court $15,800.00 $9,000.00 $6,000.00 $14,800.00

Item 2B: Fabbrini Park Basketball Court $10,750.00 $9,500.00 $3,000.00 No Bid

Item 3B: Black Bear Park Basketball Court $14,900.00 $9,500.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00

Item 4B: Huntington Park Basketball Court $9,775.00 $8,500.00 $3,000.00 $10,300.00

Item 5B: Poplar Park Basketball Courts (2) $16,300.00 $9,500.00 $6,000.00 $14,300.00

Item 6B: Willow Park Basketball Court $12,275.00 $11,500.00 $3,000.00 No Bid

Basketball Court Repairs Total $79,800.00 $48,500.00 $27,000.00 Incomplete

Tennis and Basketball Court Repair Total Bid $184,775.00 $131,000.00 $83,000.00 Incomplete
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 MEMORANDUM NO. M26-002 
 

TO:   B&G Committee 
FROM: Craig Talsma, Executive Director 
  Dustin Hugen, Director of Parks, Planning & Maintenance  
RE: Mowing Services 2026-2028 
DATE: 1/20/2026 
 
Motion: 
 
Recommend to the full board to award the mowing services bid to Gilio Landscapes for 
$120,260.00 in 2026 and, if extended, $122,665.20 in 2027 and $125,118.51 in 2028.  
 
Background: 
 
For the 2023 - 2025 mowing seasons, the park district utilized a mowing contract to complete the 
mowing of some of our level one parks and most of the level two and three park sites. The 
contract was for three years, and the service went out to bid again for the 2026-2028 mowing 
seasons. For 2026, the board has approved a budget of $180,000 in professional services for 
parks maintenance. In addition to mowing services, this budget includes all outside contractors 
used for maintenance in the parks.  
 
Staff has been pleased utilizing a mowing service that has saved both staff time and operating 
funds for the District. 
 
Rationale: 
 
Bids were opened on 1/14/2026 and we received five bids; the bid results are attached to this 
memo. The bid results also show all the parks that are being mowed by the contractor. The 
mowing contract will be for 28 weeks per year and will be a three-year contract. The contract 
amount will increase by 2% each year of the contract. Any party can terminate the contract if the 
reason is in writing prior to January 1 of the year of the contract.  
 
Prices have decrease for this service due to a decrease in fuel costs. 
 
Gilio Landscapes was the lowest responsible bidder. Gilio Landscapes was our contractor for our 
mowing services for the past three years and we were pleased with their services.  
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Scope of Work Gilio Landscape Uno Mas Landscaping Langton Group Mark 1 Landscape, Inc. Advanced Landscaping, 
LLC. 

Bid Bond X Cashier's Check X X X

Total Cost -All Parks per week (134 acres) $4,295.00 $5,716.20 $6,988.00 $5,252.00 $4,422.00

Total Cost for 28 Weeks of Mowing $120,260.00 $160,053.60 $195,664.00 $147,056.00 $123,816.00

2026 Hoffman Estates Park District Mowing Services
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Aitio cvr,

Address Total Acrcage Mowing Acrcage I mow per week Cost 28 Week Total
Armstrong 1320 Kingsdde :.-i 4Z.oo 1,t q*-ta
Bergmal l9 Ela Road 8.1 3.4 ll 3.oo '1,!r vli .t'

Birc h 1045 Ash Rd 5.8 5.5 ll Ll.o o
Brittan\ 1245 W Neu Brftton Dr 5 4.9 | 55. oo ''l '.'r'. 'lCanterburv Fields 1950 Maureen Dr 15 lt.7 1'lo -oa i.) i.,r

Charhmagne i799 Bordeaur Dr 20.3 2.3 13.o o :L .t1 t'
935 N Dovington Dr 10.3 5.5 11.;.0c Li {\bo . ot

Cipri ,1466 llarbor Cir 5.7 11 <,oo L ltlr.l.
Colony 5097 Kingston Dr 3.4 3.2 I AO,OD /-tt? .6D

Communitv 925 (;rand Canyon Pku] 1.9 Lo.co It ili. tt
I)o uglrls 3694 Whispering Trails Dr 3.1 cl {.co 1.'l 4*, t b

Evcrgreen 600 Washington Blvd 10.6 4.7 I L.t-oo )a lz.tn
Fairvicw 341 Arizona Blvd 3.4 2.3 1< .ca 'i.t (:t, ' t,

lricld 410 Durham Ln 0.6 3;i.?o 9qL,r',
I Iighland 1755 Hiehland Br"'d 11 3.4 J oS. rc ,-' . :l ' '

Hunters Ridge 1305 Hunters Ridge Ct 37.4 5.7 I 9 c ' ta I t. t:t ""
lluntcrs Ridge basin 5694 Red Oal Dr 1 0.2 a.'7.C?

Kingston 4009 Huntington BIvd 6.9 Lt A .ob I

Lincoln 1993 Dog*ood Dr 4.8 l9o 'ca 4)-oo.r"
[,ocust 145 Frederick Ln 4.6 1.5 5o.ad t '4a c 'an

Lombardl 1535 Westbun Dr 1.3 1.4 ttg. ao I L+o .a
Maple 105 lllinois Blrd 1.8 L.2 { c' ro lt LD- o.r

3810 Whispering Trails Dr 8 3.8 | 7.c."" -. : ',f '

Nonh Creenway 1075 Westbury Ln 5.5 5.6 l-i 5.o c
Nonh l win 950 flassell Rd 8.3 1.9 l2o'ov :, ),4 .

Olmstcad 11 6 l'1n '.o
Pebb le 1855 westbury Dr 3.4 3.8 I 7a, t:tt -l

I'oplar 190 | llassell Rd 3.7 3.4 lU-S .L.1 (lt ,.c
Princeton 5400 McDonough Rd t.7 0.7 1t-a, *'lt, -o,l
S eminole 3914 Whispering Trails Dr 14.5 1.'l ?q u-.c

South'l'win 985 HassellRd 8.2 4.2 lZ ).o' .t 'l L4.-o.
Sundance 4485 Sunda-nce Cir 0.9 0.8 --t7. oo k'tt , ro

4475 Thombark Dr 1.5 1.8 {5- or> I t w.n''
Tropicana 7 o.7 1)z-o o 'iQo."

Vallcr 850 Park Ln 4 3.2 I c o' '" f*1.. "
Whispering 3957 Whispering Trails Dr 6 1.9 (c o7

Wilmington 1072 Wilrnington Ln 4 4.1 I ta."r -) . ,{i',1
Winding I rails I 193 Mallard Ln 3.1 0.9 2 L-oc
Total Acres 245.6 L34 4 Lq {.cc 11a.1-L0,..

Parli

Chcstnut

2

3.1

o.7

6.9

4.8

Meadow

,1500 Olmstead Dr

"l homball(
680 Audubon St

2026 Mowing Services
Page 2
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Part Address Total Acreage Molring Acrcage I mofi perrl'eek Cost 28 Week'fottrl
Armstrong 1320 Kingsdale l )..3 5 qL.60 J 1.104_AO
Bergrnan l9 Ela Road 3.4 4 l.ll^?-t) S a qq(. qo

Birch 10.15 Ash Rd 6.8 5.5 5 4.xr - o0 $ 6. q AP. O0
tsrittafly 1245 W New Britton Dr 5 6 26. 90 I s, +67 .qo

Caaterbury Fields lg50 Maueen Dr 15 !1.7 s t{q I -uo I t3. +Sq . ?c
Charlanragne 3799 Bordcaux Dr 20.3 2.3 g qL,..{o I z. ?oq .K6

Chestnut 935 N Dovhgton Dr 10.3 5.6 $ ,-3s. zo I 6, sqi . 60
cFn 4466 Harbor Cir 5.7 5.5 5 23t.oo $ 6, q 69 .i.C

Colony 5097 Kingston Dr 3.4 5 , aq. qr) g a,?A<.2r}
Commlmitv 925 Gind C,rnyon Pk$y 2 1.9 ,$ +fl.R0 I L, ?-? 9. io

Douelrs 3694 Whispering TraiLs Dr 3.1 ttr r 1o. zo $ 4 ( Ys, 60
Evergtean 600 Washington Blvd 10.5 5 t'+ z. 2c) !5 Ll, Qzl .bo

341 Arizona Blvd 3.4 2.3 S q6.LO S ,..1oq,66
Field .ll0 Duritam Lo o.7 0.6 s L[?.Oo S r.l+L.oo

Highland 1755 Highland Blvd 11 3.4 g , q L.gc, $ 1 ,1nl . tto
Hunters Ridge 1305 Hunte6 Ridge Ct 31.4 5.7 6 21q .,,1o 3 a 1()4.. zb

Htrnters Ridge basin 5694 Red Oak Dr 1 5 qL.oo I t, r 16. OO
Kingston 4009 Huntiflgton Blvd 6.9 5.9 I Lg.t .8 o I 8, llq ,oo
Lincohl I 993 Dogwood Dr 4.8 4.8 g 7ot.Ga, sq,6qq.3o

345 Frederick Ll 4.6 1.5 5 63.00 $ r. +6q .oo
Lombardy 1535 Wcstburv Dr 1.3 7.4 g gR. eo $ r,6q6. Yo

Maple 105 IUiDois Bhd 1.8 7.2 g qo.qo 5 t.qtl .L6
Meadow 3830 1tr&ispering Trails Dr 8 3.8 I t(.ct.Lo s 11, thq. sa

Nonh Greenway 1075 WestbuN Ln 5.5 5.6 at 239 ' 7D $ u ,sr!' -L1)
Nonh Trvin 950llassell Rd 8.3 3.9 5 l6z.fio 5 .1 , ,gL, \O

Olmstead 4500 O|ll'rstead Dr 11 6 ll L<z.Ct) S ?. asA. oo
Pebble 1855 Westbury Dr 3.4 5 ls?-6o I q, q6( , K6
Poplar l90l Hassell Rd 3.7 3.4 g lte.(o 5 A.qqk-\n

Pnnceton 5400 McDonough Rd 1.7 0.1 g Llz.oo S l, l1t oO
Senlinole 3914 WhisDeriog Tmils Dr 14.5 1.7 I <21 .ifi .$g os(- zc)

South Twir 985 Hasscll Rd 8.2 4.2 S t+L qa g tl,c1<q . 2a)
S uldan,:e 4485 SuDdance Cir 0.9 0.8 * 92 .oo g t. t +C.oO
Thombark 4475 Thombark Dr 1.5 1.8 g ls.ro tr 7. llL_96
Tropicana 680 Audubon St 1 o.7 I q r.oo I t,( _oo

Valley 850 Park Ln 4 3.2 9 ,e,i.\o $ 3,aLZ .. lD
Whispering 3957 Whisp€rine Trails Dr 6 1.9 1 lq.Ko $ L, 21'1 . .to
Wih ngtun 1072 Wilrnirgton Ln 4 4.L { t +L.)-o I l. azt ui

Windirg Trails 119,1 Mallard Ln 3.1 0.9 6 q 2.oo 1l.tlL.oo
Total Acres 245.6 714 -g s,+\t.zD $ tt{os3- 6.0

2026 l\rowing Services
Page 2

U,no/Vtrs Vu Ascaf\ ng.

4.9

Farvic*

Ircl.Lst
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WttnhvbW
Address l'otal Acrcage Mowing Acreage I mow per week Cost 28 Week Total

Am$trong 1320 Kingsdah 3 2.3 i.L"tb
Bcrgnun l9 Ela Road 8.7 3.4 t'1'1 u'flLl.l

I 045 Ash Rd 6.8 5.5 I8o 1"N,lo
Brittany 1245 W New Britton Dr 5 4.9 ) .l,l L,.t1t

Canterbury Fields 1950 Vaureen I)r 15 71.7 \qL
Charlamagne 3799 Bordcaux Dr 20.3 7.3 li1 7'tzt

935 N Dovington Dr 10.3 5.5 1_sq ?,'r("
Cipri 21466 Harbor Cir 5.7 5.5 )I< 1 .l Ko

Colony 5097 Kingston Dr 3.4 L) q's[Ll
Community 925 Grand Canyon Pkwy 2 1.9 L

.L,. 
LKX

Douglas 36% Whispcring Traik Dr 3.1 3.1 lt; \ il .' lLu
Evcrgrccn 600 Washington Blvd 10.5 4.7 t@1 C'. tr t

3.4 2.3 IJ l ttt
Ficld 410 Durham t-n 0.7 0.6 7o x'{l]

Hidrland 1755 Hqhland Ilhd 11 3.4 t1l q. rq{
HunteN Ridgc 1305 I lunten Ridge Ct 31.4 5.7 L1o f vi,

I lunters Ridge ba-sin 5694 Rcd Oak Dr 1 o.2 3o ?tc,
Kingston 4009 Huntington Blvd 6.9 6.9 \5c 1.k6
Linco ln 199,1 tx)gwood l)r 4.8 4.8 [.'- Rr.t
Locust 345 frederick Ln 4.6 1.5 loo L.koo

l,ombudy 1535 Wcstbury Dr 1.3 1.4 I ot) ( ca
Maple 105 lllinois Btvd 1.8 7.2 I ) koo

Mcadow 3830 Whisperins Trails Dr 8 3.8 kq {)q"tt
North Grccnwav 1075 Westbrlrv Ln 5.5 5.6 1r( '1, q st

Norft'fwin 950 llassell Rd 8.3 3.9 i itr 1 lvq
OlnNtcad 11 6 A, za> t. tbt

Pcbble 1855 Westbury Dr 3.4 3.8 t- qoq
Poplar l90l llassell Rd 3.7 3.4 t1 7 tl.'&1,{

Princcton 5400 McDonough Rd t.7 o.7 at '1dt
3914 Whispering Trails Dr 74.5 1.7 j'tL P.(nL,

South Twin 985 Ilassell Rd 8.2 4.2 2 tvl S.'rqt
441i5 Sundancc Cir 0.9 0.8 110 t,l Lu

Thomhark I,5 1.8 1l l. 1q(
Tropicana 680 Audubon St 1 0.1 at (r0

Valley li50 PaIl( Ln 4 3.2 la', ,t, <L.,
Whispering 1957 Whi\pering Traits Dr 6 1.9 I L,Yut
Wirnington 1072 Wilmiryton Ln 4 4.7 L(,t 6.r91

Winding Tmils I I9l Mallard Ln 3.1 0.9 I o,) a, roo
'fotal Acres 245.5 134 t. rrr t4f _ ([rl

2026 Mowing Services
Page 2

Park
t,-

Bnch

Chcstnut

Fail.licw 341 Arizona Btud

4500 Olmstead Dr

Seminolc

Sundancc

4475 Thombark Dr
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[YarU- 1* ltuncLscLfk-

Pa rli Address Total Acreage Mowing Acreage I mo* per week Cost
Armstrong 1320 Kinpsda.le -l 2.3 9o"cr, Ssao-
Bcrgman 19 Ela Road 8.7 3.4 133. oo 3bqto.

Ijlirc h 1045 Ash Rd 6.8 5.5 Jt5,O.) r..^af).
Briilan] 1245 W Nerv Brinon Dr 5 4.9 i qq- or) sqorr.

Canterhur! I"iclds 1950 Maureen Dr 15 11.7 r{st.,oa) il-1ba-
Cha amagne 3799 Bordeaux Dr 20.3 2.3 qo.oo asao.

Chcsmut 935 N Dovington Dr 5.6 J \R. cYl) I r:\ Ott.
( ipri 4466 tlarbor Cir 5.7 5.5 3r's.c,o t c)a a)-

Colony 5097 Kingston Dr 3.4 3.2 Lf :f- 
^r>(lommunitv 925 (irand Canyon Pkwy ) 1.9 1.\.oo ,o-]J.

l)ougLr: 3694 Whispering l-rails Dr 3.1 irl.oo 33A3"
Flvorgreen 6fi) Washington Blvd 10.6 4.1 ^D..ra) \r{9D..
Irain icg 341 Arizona Bfud 3.4 2.3 Ao,oo J5'-?o.

ll0 Durham Ln o.7 0.5 a5-.r) 'I')O,
I Iiehland 1755 Highland BIvd 11 3.4 i33.ff 3I.qb.

Hul)tcr:j Ridgc 1305 Hunters Ridge Ct 31.4 5.7 -f,.ar. af) r.a.f \\ n -
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MEMORANDUM M26-004 

 

TO:  Building and Grounds Committee 
FROM: Craig Talsma, Executive Director 

Dustin Hugen, Director of Parks, Planning & Maintenance  
RE:  Mower Purchase   
DATE: 1/20/2026 
 
Motion: 
 
Recommend to the full board to approve the purchase of a Ventrac Tractor with tough cut and 
boom mower attachments from Burris Equipment for a total of $59,782.41.  
 
Background: 
 
Approved in the 2026 budget was $60,000 for a new mower to replace our 2014 Toro 4100 
Mower. With the budget under $60,000 and the new bid requirements on equipment, this item 
did not have to go to bid. 
 
The Toro 4100 Mower is a mower that is used only for large open area mowing and is set to be 
replaced per GIS. The Ventrac Tractor Mower gives us the ability to use the mower the same as 
the Toro 4100 mower and use it for native areas and hard to mow areas.  
 
Rationale: 
 
The Ventrac Tractor Mower gives us the ability to use the mower the same as the Toro 4100 
mower in open areas and use it for native areas and hard to mow areas as you can change the 
attachment for the area you are mowing. With this unit we also have the capability to purchase 
other attachments such as aerators, sod cutters, tilers, etc. allowing the district to have one unit 
that serves multiple purposes. 
 
Currently all our units are standalone units that fit either a mower, bobcat, or larger tractor. 
When future implements are up for replacement they will be replaced with Ventrac Attachments. 
Attached is more information on the unit.       
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TOUGH CUT
HQ682
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TOUGH CUT

Optional Accessory

Dimensions
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BOOM 
MOWER

MA900
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BOOM MOWER
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Memorandum M26-005    

To:  B&G Committee 
From:  Craig Talsma, Executive Director 
  Dustin Hugen, Director of Parks, Planning & Maintenance 
RE:   Parks, Planning & Maintenance – January Board Report 
Date:  01/20/2026 
         
MOTION    
 
Motion to recommend to the full board to include the Parks, Planning & Maintenance January Board Report in 
the January Executive Directors Report. 
 
ADMINISTRATION & CAPITAL PROJECTS  
       
TC Renovations  

Board Room carpet was replaced with new carpet to match the administration offices and recreation offices.  
We have started the painting of the mutiple areas at TC as part of the 2026 capital project renovations.  Staff 
met with contractors to get proper pricing and timing for the replacement of windows and framing in the admin 
area.    

Administration    

Bids have been opened for asphalt work, court repairs, mowing services.  Purchases are being set for new 
mowers, vehicles and zambonis.  Construction meetings have taken place for roofing projects and solar projects.   

New staff members have been hired and started on January 5. Andrew Evans is the new Golf Course 
Superintendent. Andrew comes to us from Lockport Park District where he has been the Golf Course 
Superintendent for the past 7 years at Prairie Bluff. Andrew was at Bridges of Poplar Creek from 2011 to 2013 
as the Assistant Golf Course Superintendent and then spent four years in private industry before his tenure at 
Prairie Bluff. We are very excited to have him and look forward to his work at Bridges of Poplar Creek. 
Christian Perez was hired as a Building Technician; Christian was previously working as a part time custodian 
at Bridges of Poplar Creek and demonstrated great workmanship while there. In his new role as a full-time 
employee, he will be taking care of our pools and spas at The Club, TC and Seascape while assisting the 
building maintenance team.  

 
AQUATICS AND BUILDINGS   
 
Triphahn Center:  

• Installed new inducer on RTU 6 in Admin office and new flame sensor and ignitor on RTU 7. 
• Basketball hoop #1 on the north side was not lowering; repaired key switch mechanism to restore functioning.  
• Chicago faucet cartridges were installed in downstairs men’s locker rooms, and the drain line was rodded out in 

men’s lower-level locker rooms.  
• New lighting was installed in Room 114, and a new ballast was installed in hockey locker rooms.  
• Safety outlet covers were added throughout common areas of TC. 
• Installed new electric and ran HDMI cables for new TVs in the board room. 
• Administration offices had new supply vent diffusers installed. 
• Electrical outage occurred for every other light in lower-level ice rinks. Emergency circuit was tripped (shorted 

from roof leak) – reset breaker to restore power.  
• All expired ammonia relief valves were replaced.  
• Parks team assisted with construction/painting at TC & Vogelei when snow operations were not necessary.  28



• Installation of drywall was completed, except for the window walls of the conference room.  
• Sanded and mudded drywall in the new admin area and cubicle walls. Painted wood trim for the top of the cubicle 

walls and started install. Shelf was hung above the copier. 
• Metro Door & Dock is scheduled to do yearly drop test on Zamboni doors.  

The Club at Prairie Stone:  
• Problematic check valve on lap pool; the check valve would not close during filter cleaning. Opened check valve 

and wiped surfaces clean to resolve issue.  
• Blower fan faulted on activity pool Seresco – manually reset phase monitor and VFD.  
• New mechanical seal was installed on spa filter pump. 
• Replaced solenoid on automatic faucet in women’s locker room and rodded urinal in men’s community locker 

room. 

Willow Rec: 
• Ran electric for Stanley Access for both new automatic front doors.  
• Fixed drywall above the new doors, filled side gaps with backing rod and installed foam pieces along bottom of 

the door to close gaps.  

Vogelei:  
• Ceiling fan was removed from Vogelei Barn.  
• Removed and re-routed electric for remodel of upstairs rooms. Combined light circuits for all three areas and 

installed all new face plates.  
• Moved furniture to Vogelei Barn and assisted with painting and clean up afterwards.  
• Transported and built shelving for the greenhouse. 

Bridges: 
• Met with Metro Door & Dock for door repair at Bridges maintenance shop.  

Seascape: 
• Heater in bath house sprinkler room burnt out the contactor, causing room to dip below freezing. The sprinkler 

system was drained down by the fire department, and we were able to replace contactor and restore heat. 
However, the fire system back flow device appears to be cracked and will need to be repaired by Total Fire.  
 

PARKS  

 
Parks & Forestry:  

• Ice depth checks were conducted at Evergreen, North/South Twin, Fabbrini, Black Bear, South Ridge, and North 
Ridge.  

• Cleared snow along school sidewalks at Armstrong Park and Sycamore Park.  
• Snow detailing was done around buildings, as well as salting paths. Ice and snow were treated at The Club, 

Willow Rec, TC and Vogelei.  
• Weekly trash removal services were performed throughout the parks and dog parks.  
• Inventory was taken for benches, and trash can counts at all of the parks.  
• Parks team assessed storm damage and did branch pickup/removal at the West parks, as needed.  
• Tree maintenance/clean up was done at Community Park, as well as maintenance for downed tree at Black Bear. 
• Assembled fixtures at Vogelei park and fixture count/inspection done at various parks.  
• Worked on cleaning native seeds.  
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Playgrounds:  
• Removed ripped windscreens and drop screens from Fabbrini for the winter. Ripped windscreens were taken 

down at Pine Park sled hill and repaired a windscreen at TC. 
• Evergreen playground had a broken gate that was fixed.  
• Routine playground checks and clean-ups were conducted.  
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4Q2025 Parks Goals 
Page 1 of 6  

HOFFMAN ESTATES PARK DISTRICT  
2025 BUDGET GOALS & OBJECTIVES 
PARKS, PLANNING & MAINTENANCE 

 
Key: C = Complete / O = On Track / D = Deferred / N= Not Complete 

 
 

DISTRICT CORNERSTONE #1:  HEALTHY AND ENJOYABLE EXPERIENCES 
 

Objective/Goal Performance Measures Status 
Parks Shoreline Maintenance  Maintain healthy shorelines with water views and access 

points.  
C 

1Q Comments: Shorelines have been mowed and/or burned, and inspections have begun.  
2Q Comments: Shorelines and water views/access points continue to be maintained. 
3Q Comments: Shorelines and water views/access points continue to be maintained. 
4Q Comments - Complete Shorelines were maintained all year with water views and access 

points and will continue to be a regular maintenance program. 
 

Cipri Playground  Replace the playground and fall surface at Cipri Park. C 
1Q Comments: Playground equipment is purchased and installer selected. Install is fall of 

2025. 
2Q Comments - Complete Playground and fall surface have been installed. 

 
Sycamore Park Playground  Install a new playground at Sycamore Park in the fall of 2025. C 
1Q Comments: Playground equipment purchased; installer has been selected with work to 

be performed in summer of 2025. 
2Q Comments: Playground installation is in progress with expected completion date 

of August 10. 
3Q Comments - Complete Project completed in September with grown in taking place.  

 
Bell Works Playground  Install a new playground at Bell Works once Bell Works has 

completed land donation.  
D 

1Q Comments – Deferred to 2026 Project is estimated to begin in 2026. 
 

Park Shelter Renovations  Renovate the park shelter at Olmstead Park and water 
overlook shelter at Fabbrini Park. 

D/C 

1Q Comments: Shelters will be renovated later in 2025. 
2Q Comments: Shelters will be renovated later in 2025. 
3Q Comments: Olmstead Shelter moved to 2028 with the playground replacement at 

Olmstead.  Fabbrini is being completed.  
4Q Comments: Fabbrini shelter completed. Olmstead Shelter moved to 2028 with the 

playground replacement at Olmstead.   
 

Dog Park Features  Install new dog park features at Bo’s Run and Freedom Run. C 
1Q Comments: Equipment has been ordered.  
2Q Comments - Complete  New dog park ramps and toys have been installed and old wooden 

structures have been removed. 
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4Q2025 Parks Goals 
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Seascape New Park  Finish the new park at Seascape Family Aquatic Center to be 
open before the pool opens.  

C 

1Q Comments: Estimated open date of May 16, 2025. 
2Q Comments - Complete Moon Lake Park is complete. Ribbon cutting ceremony took place on 

May 17. 
 

Hunters Ridge OSLAD  If the OSLAD is awarded, start the first phase of the OSLAD 
project at Hunters Ridge.  

C 

1Q Comments: No OSLAD, new playground renovation is underway.  
2Q Comments – Complete 
 

New playground equipment and fall surface are installed, and new 
park opened on May 24. 

 
Vogelei Park OSLAD  Continue the Vogelei Park OSLAD project; items to be 

completed by year end.  
C 

1Q Comments: Phase one is near completion with phase two in process.  
2Q Comments: Old playground, splash pad and landscape walls have been removed; staff 

is working on earthwork plan; installation of new equipment is expected in 
mid-August, with additional phase two work to follow.  

3Q Comments: Playground and Sensory Garden installed.  On track to open in the spring 
of 2026. 

4Q Comments - Complete Completed 2026 planned portion; Restoration and punch list items to 
be completed as weather allows in 2026.  

 
Facility Upgrades at WRC  Conversion of racquetball courts to functional fitness/ninja 

warrior; mini gym conversion to gymnastic center and facility 
front entrance renovations.  

C 

1Q Comments: Project to start August 18, 2025.  
2Q Comments: Project to start August 18, 2025.  
3Q Comments: Majority completed, lights and front doors still to be completed.  Lead 

times were extended by manufacturers.  
4Q Comments - Complete Upgrades are complete.  
  
Vogelei Barn Upgrades  The upstairs of Vogelei Barn will be renovated to become a 

multipurpose space.  
C 

1Q Comments: Project to start October 2025.  
2Q Comments: Project to start October 2025. 
3Q Comments: Project will start October 27.  
4Q Comments - Complete Upgrades are complete.  

 
BPC Patio Furniture  Purchase new patio tables and chairs at BPC.  C 
1Q Comments - Complete Purchase completed and equipment is out on the patio.  

 
BPC Driving Range Artificial Mats  Replace all artificial mats at the driving range with 

continuous artificial turf to match the new area installed in 
2023.  

C 

1Q Comments: Project started 4/9/2025.  
2Q Comments - Complete Installation of the new mats and restoration around the mats was 

completed in May. 
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4Q2025 Parks Goals 
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DISTRICT CORNERSTONE #2:  SOCIAL EQUITY 
 

Objective/Goal Performance Measures Status 
ADA Certification  Staff members beginning the process of becoming ADA 

Certified to complete our next Accessibility Assessment.  
D 

1Q Comments: Looking into options for certification.  
2Q Comments: Looking into options for certification. 
3Q Comments: Plan to complete in 4th quarter.  
4Q Comments: Deferred to 2026 to coincide with Accessibility Assessment. 

 
TC Spa Handicap Lift  Replace the handicap lift for the spa at TC.  C 
1Q Comments: Being scheduled. 
2Q Comments: Being scheduled for later in the year. 
3Q Comments: 4th quarter project.  
4Q Comments - Complete Lift has been replaced.  

 
 

DISTRICT CORNERSTONE #3:  FINANCIAL & ENVIRONMENTAL STEWARDSHIP  
 

Objective/Goal Performance Measures Status 
Hold Special Events for 
Environmental Awareness  

Hold Earth Day, Seed Bombing, Invasive Removal and Seed 
Collection events.  

C 

1Q Comments: Events are all planned.  
2Q Comments: Earth Day, Seed Bombing and Invasive Plant Removal Events were held 

at various parks. Seed Collection is planned for October. 
3Q Comments - Complete Seed collection event took place October 11.  
 
Audubon International  
 

Continue the certification process for becoming Audubon 
Cooperative Sanctuary Program for Golf Courses  

D/O 

1Q Comments: This process is ongoing. 
2Q Comments: This process is ongoing. 
3Q Comments: This process is ongoing and will not be completed in 2025.  The process 

has started and should be completed in 2026.  
4Q Comments: The process has been continued and will be ongoing until full 

completed.  
 
Arboretum Status at Vogelei  
 

Once greenhouse and tree nursery are complete apply for and 
receive complete arboretum certification. 

D 

1Q Comments: Once the OSLAD project is finished then staff will apply.  
2Q Comments: Once the OSLAD project is finished then staff will apply.  
3Q Comments: Once the OSLAD project is finished then staff will apply. 
4Q Comments: OSLAD project finalized documents will not take place until Spring 

of 2026.  Once those are finalized then arboretum certification will be 
applied for.  

 
Controlled Burns at Select Parks 
 

Contract with vendor to complete controlled burns in sections 
of Victoria and Hunters Ridge Park.  

C 

1Q Comments: Victoria Park complete. If necessary, Hunters Ridge burn will take place 
in the fall or winter.  
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2Q Comments: Victoria Park complete. If necessary, Hunters Ridge burn will take place 
in the fall or winter. 

3Q Comments: Remaining burns will take place as weather allows.  
4Q Comments - Complete Burns have been completed.  
 
Groundmaster 7200 Mower  Purchase a Groundmaster 7200 mower. C 
1Q Comments: Purchase of new mower is complete, waiting on delivery.  
2Q Comments - Complete New mower has been received. 
 
Utility Vehicle Purchases  Purchase a Workman HDX and Workman 2110 or similar. C 
1Q Comments: Purchase is complete, waiting on delivery.  
2Q Comments - Complete Utility Vehicles have been received. 
 
BPC Main Floor Vinyl Flooring  Replace all flooring at BPC on the main floor with vinyl.  C 
1Q Comments - Complete Project Complete 
 
Fleet Vehicle Purchases  Purchase two fleet trucks to replace a GMC 2500 and Dodge 

Ram 2500.  
C 

1Q Comments: Orders have been placed; delivery is set for May 2025. 
1Q Comments - Complete Fleet trucks have been received. 
 
Kids Room and Playground Area 
Renovation at The Club 

Convert old kids’ room to multipurpose room and old 
playground area to outdoor fitness area.  

C 

1Q Comments: Kids’ room conversion is complete and outdoor is in progress.  
2Q Comments - Complete Outdoor fitness area is complete. 
 
Wolves Offices & North Side 
Rooms Renovations  

Convert Wolves’ offices into usable space for HEParks staff 
and renovate north side offices to become multipurpose 
rooms.  

C 

1Q Comments: Scheduled for August/September 2025. 
2Q Comments: Staff has removed furniture and patched holes in the walls. Painting and 

carpet will be done soon, as outdoor weather allows staff to work indoors.  
3Q Comments: Recreation Offices are complete and remainder of project is set for 

November and December of 2025.  
4Q Comments - Complete Planned work for 2025 completed.  

 
The Club Third Tennis Court 
Conversion  

Convert the old third tennis court area into more fitness 
opportunities.  

C 

1Q Comments - Complete Renovation completed.  
 
 

DISTRICT CORNERSTONE #4:  OPERATIONAL EXCELLENCE  
 

Objective/Goal Performance Measures Status 
 
Engineering for The Club Roof 
Project  

Release an RFP / obtain proposals for the engineering for the 
roof replacement at The Club.  

C 

1Q Comments: Working with vendors to provide a proposal for roof construction.  
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2Q Comments: Working with vendors to provide a proposal for roof construction. 
3Q Comments: Working with vendors to provide a proposal for roof construction. 
4Q Comments - Complete Contract is in place.  
 
Facility RTU Replacements Replace RTU 1 and 3 at TC and RTU 11 and 13 at The Club.  C 
1Q Comments: Planning is in place.  
2Q Comments: Cahill Heating & Air has been selected/approved by the Board for this 

work, to begin soon. 
3Q Comments - Complete Units were installed the week of October 13.  
 
Zamboni Purchase  Purchase a new Zamboni for ice operations. C 
1Q Comments - Complete Order has been placed; expected delivery November 2025. 
 
Replace Stairs Treads at TC  Replace all stair treads at TC. C 
1Q Comments - Complete Treads were replaced on 4/7/2025-4/11/2025.  

 
Valley Park Concrete Work  Replace and/or repair concrete paths at Valley Park and 

replace the concrete half basketball court at Valley Park.  
C 

1Q Comments: Weather dependent work.  
2Q Comments: Weather dependent work.  
3Q Comments - Complete Completed 
 
Asphalt Repairs – Multiple 
Locations  

Complete crack fill and sealcoating at the following district 
owned parking lots: The Club, Seascape, South Ridge South, 
Huntington Park. Path overlays will be completed at 
Huntington-South Ridge and Walnut Pond.  

C 

1Q Comments: Agreement with contractor is in place, all work dependent on weather.  
2Q Comments: Seascape, South Ridge and Hunters Ridge parking lots are complete. 

Parking lot at The Club and path overlays at Walnut Pond are being 
scheduled. 

3Q Comments - Complete Completed 
 
BPC Kitchen Appliances   Replace Vulcan Warming Oven and Kitchen Sink with pre-

rinse faucet assembly.  
C 

1Q Comments: Oven has been ordered and receiving quotes for the faucet assembly.  
2Q Comments: Vulcan Oven is installed. Staff is still investigating options for faucet 

assembly. 
3Q Comments - Complete Vulcan oven replaced and sink assembly is working great and not 

being replaced with GIS dates changed.  
 
BPC Bridge Abutments  Install new bridge abutments from bridge to existing asphalt 

on remaining bridges not completed in 2024.  
C 

1Q Comments: To be completed on 4/15/2025.  
2Q Comments - Complete Project was completed in April. 
 
BPC Patio Grill Station  Build a new area for an outdoor grill station at BPC in the 

area near the halfway house.  
D 

1Q Comments: To be completed on 4/15/2025 

35



4Q2025 Parks Goals 
Page 6 of 6  

2Q Comments – Deferred to 2026 Pushing back this project, as the cost exceeded our budget 
expectations. Staff will reevaluate for 2026. 

 
 
Resurface Whirlpool Bottom at The 
Club  

 Remove the existing tile bottom and have it resurfaced during 
normal pool closure for maintenance.  

C 

1Q Comments: To be completed during pool shut down in August.  
2Q Comments: To be completed during pool shut down in August.  
3Q Comments - Complete Completed 
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