
Scope of Work Everline Coatings and 
Services

American Sealcoating of 
Indiana, Inc. 

Sport Surface Pros, LLC Us Tennis Court 
Construction Co. 

Bid Bond X X X

Item 1T: Olmstead Tennis Courts (2) $26,375.00 $19,000.00 $14,000.00 $28,650.00

Item 2T: Willow Recreation Tennis Courts (2) $28,600.00 $19,000.00 $14,000.00 No Bid

Item 3T: Fabbrini Tennis (1) / Pickle Ball Courts (10) $50,000.00 $44,500.00 $28,000.00 No Bid

Tennis Court Repairs Total $104,975.00 $82,500.00 $56,000.00 Incomplete

Item 1B: Olmstead Park Basketball Court $15,800.00 $9,000.00 $6,000.00 $14,800.00

Item 2B: Fabbrini Park Basketball Court $10,750.00 $9,500.00 $3,000.00 No Bid

Item 3B: Black Bear Park Basketball Court $14,900.00 $9,500.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00

Item 4B: Huntington Park Basketball Court $9,775.00 $8,500.00 $3,000.00 $10,300.00

Item 5B: Poplar Park Basketball Courts (2) $16,300.00 $9,500.00 $6,000.00 $14,300.00

Item 6B: Willow Park Basketball Court $12,275.00 $11,500.00 $3,000.00 No Bid

Basketball Court Repairs Total $79,800.00 $48,500.00 $27,000.00 Incomplete

Tennis and Basketball Court Repair Total Bid $184,775.00 $131,000.00 $83,000.00 Incomplete

2026 Court Repair, Color Coating Striping at Multiple Locations
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