
Category Product Size Advanced Turf Solutions Chicagoland Turf SiteOne Arthur Clesen Inc. BTSI
Nutrients 12-Iron Chelated case 2x2.5 gal No Bid $61.76 $41.90 No Bid $80.00
Herbicide 2-D case 2x1 gal No Bid $167.77 $172.90 $172.00 $175.50
Nutrients 43-0-0 Shaws Surf 6 bag 50# No Bid $37.29 No Bid No Bid $34.00
Wetting
Agent Alypso case 2x2.5 gal $284.06 $385.15 No Bid $385.15 No Bid
Nutrients Anderson 25-0-3 (Rough grade) bag 50# No Bid $14.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
PGR Anew case 4x1.5# $426.60 $426.60 $426.60 $426.66 $426.60
Herbicide Barricade 4FL case 2x1 gal No Bid $286.00 $286.00 $143.00/gal No Bid
Fungicide Briskway case 2x1 gal No Bid $2,710.00 $2,710.00 $2,710.00 No Bid
Fungicide Chlorothalonil case 2x2.5 gal $270.00 $200.00 $216.00 $189.00 $220.00
Fungicide Dac Action case 2x2.5 gal No Bid $405.00 $405.00 $405.00 No Bid
Herbicide Defendor jug 1 qt $184.00 $184.00 $184.00 $184.00 $184.00
Nutrients Foltec SG Minors case 10 x2.25# No Bid $209.00 No Bid $209.00 No Bid
Nutrients Foundation 40 case 2x2.5 gal $525.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Herbicide Glyphosate case 2x2.5 gal $120.00 $90.00 $68.50 $69.00 No Bid
Nutrients Hydra-Fense case 2x2.5 gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $200.00
Nutrients Hydra-Kace case 2x2.5 gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $150.00
Pigment Jet Black Pond Dye (Powder) case - 4
cartons $270.00 $239.34 No Bid $249.00 Alternate Submitted
Nutrients Lesco NOS bag 50# No Bid No Bid $21.00 No Bid No Bid
Fungicide Lexicon case 4x21 fl oz $2,003.40 $2,003.40 $2,003.40 No Bid No Bid
Herbicide Lontrel Bottle qt $175.00 $198.00 $147.55 $179.00 $145.00
Insecticide Meridian 25 WG Jug 102 oz No Bid $510.00 $2,040.00 / 4 x 102 case $510.00 No Bid
Aquatic Phoslock bag 55# No Bid $182.60 $182.60 No Bid $182.60
Fungicide Pinpoint case 4x60 fl oz $1,617.00 $1,617.00 $1,617.00 $1,617.00 $1,617.00
Fungicide Posterity Jug 105 fl oz No Bid $1,890.00 $1,890.00 $1,890.00 No Bid
PGR Primo Maxx case 2x1 gal No Bid $580.00 $580.00 $580.00 Alternate Submitted
Fungicide Propiconazole case 2x2.5 gal $360.00 $343.75 $279.00 $289.00 $235.00
PGR Proxy case 2x2.5 gal $190.00 $160.00 $178.00 No Bid Alternate Submitted
Herbicide Quicksilver T&O 8 fl oz bottle $140.00 $179.00 $630.00 $157.00 $154.00
Aquatic Reward case 2x2.5 gal No Bid $395.00 $395.00 $395.00 No Bid
Aquatic Seaclear G bag 20# No Bid $80.80 $72.10 $85.00 $170.00
Fungicide Secure Action case 2x2.5 gal No Bid $3,250.00 $3,250.00 $3,250.00 No Bid
Supplies Signal Blue Spray Indicator case 4x1 gal $119.00 $105.00 No Bid $99.00 Alternate Submitted
Aquatic SonarOne pail 20# $950.00 $659.40 $659.40 $799.00 $659.40
Herbicide Specticide Total case 4x144 fl
oz $300.00 $275.00 $251.20 $269.00 No Bid
Supplies Incide Out Tank Cleaner case 4x1 gal $16 per 32oz Erase Cleaner $126.00 No Bid No Bid Alternate Submitted
Fungicide Tebuconazole case 4x1 gal $340.00 $272.50 $254.00 $266.00 $250.00
Fungicide Tekken Jug 1 gal No Bid $135.00 $540.00 No Bid $135.00
Herbicide Tenacity Jug 1 gal Alternate Submitted $775.00 $775.00 $775.00 Alternate Submitted
Fungicide Tourney Case 4x5 lb $2,854.00 $2,854.00 $2,854.00 $2,854.00 $2,854.00
Herbicide Trimec Bent case 2x2.5 gal $135.00 $205.00 No Bid No Bid $207.00
Pigment Turf Screen case 2x2.5 gal $450.00 $530.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pigment Turf Screen Clear case 2x2.5 gal $395.00 $375.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Phos Acid Turf Summer Stress Phiter case 2x2.5 gal No Bid $109.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wetting
Agent TV Siphon case 2x2.5 gal No Bid $270.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Herbicide Vessel case 2x2.5 gal No Bid $138.23 $105.56 Alternate Submitted Alternate Submitted
Wetting
Agent Vivax case 2x2.5 gal $383.40 $364.25 No Bid $364.25 No Bid
Nutrients Worm Power Turf case 2x2.5 gal No Bid $125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Fungicide Xzemplar case 2x114 fl
oz $2,952.60 $2,952.60 $2,952.60 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL BID AWARDED (based on 
Department requests) $7,420.60 $59,848.55 $5,039.64 $1,624.50 $8,677.50


	Memo for Board

