2019 Fertilizer and Chemical Early Program- Bid Results

Fungicides Size Advanced Turf | Arthur Clesen | Chicagoland Turf | Site-One
Briskway 2x1 gal No Bid $2,682.00 $2,682.00 $2,682.00
Chlorothalonil 2x2.5 gal $270.00 No Bid $250.00 $230.00
Dac Action 2x 2.5 gal No Bid $400.00 $400.00 $400.00
Interface 2x 2.5 gal $772.50 $772.00 $772.50 $772.50
Lexicon 4x21floz $2,003.40 No Bid $2,003.40 $2,003.40
Pinpoint 4 x 60 fl oz $1,466.40 $1,466.40 $1,466.40 $1,466.40
Posterity 2 x 105 fl oz No Bid $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00
Secure Action 2x 2.5 gal No Bid $3,100.00 $3,100.00 $3,100.00
Stress Phiter 2x 2.5 gal No Bid $114.00 $109.30 No Bid
Tebuconazole 4x1 gal No Bid $249.00 $300.00 $288.00
Tekken 1 gal No Bid No Bid $135.00 No Bid
Tourney 4x51b $2,771.00 $2,771.00 $2,771.00 $2,771.00
Herbicides Size

2-D 2x1gal No Bid $329.00 $333.76 $179.50
Barricade 2x1gal No Bid $286.00 $286.00 $286.00
Barricade 10 gal No Bid $1,380.00 $1,380.00 No Bid
Defendor 1qt $184.00 $184.00 $184.00 $184.00
Dimension 2x 2.5 gal $1,050.00 $1,050.00 $1,050.00 $1,157.50
Fusilade 4 x1qt No Bid $284.50 $313.20 $263.28
Horse Power 2x 2.5 gal No Bid $336.00 $309.44 $310.00
Lontrel 1qt $190.00 $177.42 $165.00 $144.00
Octane 8 oz $79.00 $64.92 $75.10 $62.69
Roundup (Razor Pro) 2 x 2.5 gal No Bid $69.00 $108.13 $62.00
Specticle Total 4 x 144 fl oz $340.00 $263.00 $275.20 $240.92
Tenacity 1 gal $730.00 $775.00 $775.00 $775.00
Teremec Bent Formula 2 x 2.5 gal $135.00 No Bid $220.00 $200.54
Vessel 2 x 2.5 gal No Bid $131.00 $140.00 $110.00
Plant Growth Regulators Size

Anuew 4x1.51b $390.00 $390.00 $390.00 $390.00




Cutless 2x2.5 gal $1,897.20 $1,860.00 $1,925.10 $1,925.00
Primo 2x1gal $370-sub $580.00 $580.00 $580.00
Primo 10 gal No Bid $2,740.00 $2,740.00 No Bid
Proxy 2 x2.5 gal $195.00 $188.00 $147.22 $168.00
Aquatics Size

Captian XTR 2 x 2.5 gal $198.00 $159.00 $166.60 $144.74
Clipper SC 64 0z $640.00 $545.50 $545.60 $640.00
Phoslock 55 Ib No Bid No Bid $177.28 $182.60
Reward 2x2.5 gal $375 Sub $395.00 $395.00 $395.00
Sonar 1 20 Ib $825.00 $769.00 $649.00 $659.40
Insecticides Size

Acelepryn 4x .5 gal No Bid $4,006.00 $4,006.00 $4,006.00
Meridian 4x102 oz No Bid $1,917.60 $1,917.60 $1,917.60
Wetting Agents Size

Cascade Plus 2x2.5 gal $406.00 $355.00 $470.00 No Bid
TS Clear 2x2.5 gal $395.00 No Bid $375.00 No Bid
Turfscreen 2 x 2.5 gal $530.00 No Bid $530.00 No Bid
TV 23 2x2.5 gal No Bid No Bid $80.00 No Bid
TV Siphon 2x 2.5 gal No Bid No Bid $270.00 No Bid
Vivax 2 x 2.5 gal $384.40 $364.26 $383.40 No Bid
Granular Fertilizers Size

10-2-8 Nature safe 50 Ib No Bid No Bid $40.39 No Bid
43-0-0 Shaws Surf 6 50 Ib No Bid No Bid $39.87 No Bid
Anderson 14-7-14 DG 401b $51.30 $51.30 $50.80 No Bid
Anderson 25-0-3 Rough 50 1b No Bid $16.62 $14.40 $14.50
Anderson 25-0-8 Fairway 50 Ib No Bid No Bid $24.60 No Bid
Foltec 16-0-16 3x13.61b No Bid $198.00 $198.00 No Bid
KMAG 50 lb No Bid $20.50 No Bid $27.29
Silica 2 x2.5 gal $580.00 $129.00 No Bid $277.00
Liquid Fertilizers Size

12-Iron Chelated 2 x2.5 gal No Bid No Bid $95.87 $27.50




Bent Special 251b $36.00 $26.50 $41.00 S44.53
Foundation 40 2x 2.5 gal $550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wormpower 2 x 2.5 gal No Bid No Bid $117.50 No Bid
Misc. Products Size

DeFoamer 1qt $16.50 $14.08 $21.00 $6.00
Jet Black Pond Dye 24 x5.25 oz case |[$67.50 No Bid $264.00 No Bid
Pigment remover 1qt $39.00 $13.25 $24.00 No Bid
Signal 4x1 gal $118.00 $94.00 No Bid No Bid
Tank Cleaner 21b No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.83
TVSTS Compatibility Agent 4x1 gal No Bid No Bid $208.00 No Bid




