
Fertilizer/Chemical Bid

10/10/17

Fungicides 
Briskway (A) No Bid 2,630.00$  2 x 1 gal 2,630.00$  2 x 1 gal 2,630.00$  2 x 1 gal      

115.80$      AT 2.5 gal 134.00$      QP DF 2 x 10 lb 165.00$      2 x 2.5 gal 186.26$      Manicure 2 x 2.5 gal

166.70$      AT 20 lb 120.00$      Manicure Ultra 4 x 5 lb

Dac Action (A) No Bid 388.00$      2 x 2.5 gal 388.00$      2 x 2.5 gal 388.00$      2 x 2.5 gal

Headway (A) No Bid 834.00$      2 x 1 gal 834.00$      2 x 1 gal 834.00$      2 x 1 gal

Interface (A) 386.25$      2.5 gal 772.50$      2 x 2.5 gal 772.50$      2 x 2.5 gal 772.50$      2 x 2.5 gal

Iprodione 131.32$      AT 2.5 gal 204.00$      QP 2 x 2.5 gal 194.40$      2 x 2.5 gal 208.32$      18 Plus 2 x 2.5 gal

Lexicon (A) 1,935.36$  4 x 21 fl oz No Bid 1,879.08$  4 x 21 fl oz 1,935.36$  4 x 21 fl oz

Mirage (A) 446.25$      2.5 gal 892.50$      2 x 2.5 gal 892.50$      2 x 2.5 gal 892.50$      2 x 2.5 gal

Pinpoint 366.60$      60 fl oz 1,466.40$  4 x 60 fl oz 1,466.40$  4 x 60 fl oz 1,490.84$  4 x 60 fl oz

Secure (A) No Bid 2,940.00$  2 x 2.5 gal 2,940.00$  2 x 2.5 gal 2,940.00$  2 x 2.5 gal

Tebuconazole 64.13$        AT 1 gal 240.00$      QP 4 x 1 gal 240.00$      4 x 1 gal 246.32$      4 x 1 gal

120.00$      AT44 2.5 gal 115.00$      Stress Phitter 2 x 2.5 gal 99.20$        Stress Phitter 2 x 2.5 gal 181.90$      Kphite 2 x 2.5 gal

99.62$        GreenFlo Phyte 2 x 2.5 gal

Herbicides 

2-D No Bid 328.00$      4 x 1 gal 176.47$      2 x 1 gal 183.96$      2 x 1 gal

No Bid 572.00$      2 x 1 gal 286.00$      2 x 1 gal 1,380.00$  4FL 10 gal

No Bid 1,380.00$  10 gal 1,025.00$  65WG 10 x 5 lb

Defendor (A) 184.00$      1 qt No Bid 736.00$      4 x 1 qt 184.00$      1 qt

114.00$      64 fl oz 1,080.00$  2 x 2.5 gal 997.22$      2 x 2.5 gal 1,050.00$  2 x 2.5 gal

525.00$      2.5 gal 1,067.00$  Bundle

Fusilade No Bid 574.00$      8 x1 qt 312.00$      4 x1 qt 66.54$        1 qt

Lontrel 155.02$      1 qt 2,079.00$  12 x 1 qt 698.82$      4 x 1 qt 154.39$      1 qt

Octane 62.85$        8 oz 775.00$      12 x 8 oz 79.00$        8 oz 60.00$        8 oz

Prodiamine 55.13$        AT 5 lb No Bid 470.00$      2 x 2.5 gal 465.65$      Stonewall 65WDG 5 x10 lb

Snapshot 76.45$        50 lb 49.00$        25 lb 58.00$        25 lb 441.12$      6 x 50 lb

Horse Power 148.76$      2.5 gal 327.00$      2 x 2.5 gal 306.05$      2 x 2.5 gal 341.28$      2 x 2.5 gal

Specticle Total 59.24$        114 fl oz 250.00$      4 x 144 fl oz 327.61$      4 x 144 fl oz 66.24$        144 fl oz

Teremec Bent Formula No Bid No Bid 191.68$      2 x 2.5 gal No Bid

Vessel No Bid 121.00$      2 x 2.5 gal 141.50$      2 x 2.5 gal No Bid

Plant Growth Regulators

Anuew 97.50$        1.5 lb 1,560.00$  4x 4 x 1.5 lb 1,560.00$  16 x 1.5 lb 390.00$      4 x 1.5 lb

Cutless (A) 930.00$      2.5 gal 1,860.00$  2 x 2.5 gal 1,860.00$  2 x 2.5 gal 1,860.00$  2 x 2.5 gal

No Bid 580.00$      2 x 1 gal 580.00$      2 x 1 gal 580.00$      2 x 1 gal

2,740.00$  10 gal 10 gal 2,740.00$  10 gal

Proxy No Bid 171.00$      2 x 2.5 gal 162.70$      2 x 2.5 gal 191.22$      2 x 2.5 gal

Trimmit (A) No Bid 2,025.00$  2 x 2.5 gal 884.00$      2 x 1 gal 2,025.00$  2 x 2.5 gal

Aquatics

Phosphites

Advanced Turf Arthur Clesen Chicagoland Turf Site-One

Chlorothalonil

Barricade (A)

Dimension

Primo (A)
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Captian XTR 77.22$        2.5 gal 154.00$      2 x 2.5 gal 144.44$      2 x 2.5 gal 167.28$      2 x 2.5 gal

Sonar 1 No Bid 749.00$      20 lb 643.00$      20 lb 276.00$      1 gal

Clipper SC 139.30$      1 lb No Bid 1,170.12$  1 gal 876.66$      6 x 1 lb

Insecticides

Acelepryn (A) No Bid 3,910.00$  4 x .5 gal 3,910.00$  4 x 1 gal 977.50$      64 oz

No Bid 385.00$      4 x 17 oz 1,876.80$  4 x 102 oz 1,876.80$  4 x 102 oz

542.94$      6 x 17 oz

Wetting Agents

Turfscreen 265.00$      2.5 gal No Bid 530.00$      2 x 2.5 gal No Bid

TV 23 No Bid No Bid 74.00$        2 x 2.5 gal No Bid

TV Siphon No Bid No Bid 235.00$      2 x 2.5 gal No Bid

188.53$      2.5 gal 361.76$      2 x 2.5 gal 380.00$      2 x 2.5 gal No Bid

1,331.20$  20 gal

Granular Fertilizers

Anderson 14-7-14 DG 50.30$        40 lb 50.30$        40 lb 50.30$        40 lb No Bid

Anderson 25-0-3 Rough No Bid No Bid 15.45$        50 lb No Bid

Anderson 25-0-8 Fairway No Bid No Bid 23.50$        50 lb No Bid

Anderson Humic Urea 25.00$        50 lb 52.80$        40 lb 25.00$        50 lb No Bid

KMAG No Bid 19.50$        50 lb 24.25$        50 lb 21.89$        0-0-22E 50 lb

33.53$        Fine grade No Bid 40.39$        50 lb No Bid

32.20$        coarse grade No Bid

Milorganite No Bid No Bid 12.00$        50 lb 8.98$          6-2-0 50 lb

43-0-0 Shaws Surf 6 No Bid No Bid 41.09$        50 lb No Bid

Liquid Fertilizers

Bent Special 26.63$        25 lb 24.00$        25 lb 30.00$        25 lb No Bid

Corn syrup No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Plant Food Kelp Iron No Bid 132.00$      2 x 2.5 gal 193.00$      2 x 2.5 gal No Bid

Wormpower No Bid No Bid 117.50$      2 x 2.5 gal No Bid

Misc. Products

DeFoamer 14.09$        knockdown 1 qt 189.00$      Knockdown 12 x 1 qt 246.24$      12 x 1 qt 56.04$        Recede 12 x 16 fl oz

Pigment remover 24.66$        1 qt 149.00$      Erase 12 x 1 qt 24.17$        1 qt No Bid

Tank Cleaner 13.83$        Erase 1 qt 149.00$      Incide Out 12 x 1 qt 237.48$      12 x 1 qt 57.24$        LescoSol 12 x 2 lb

TVSTS Compatibility Agent No Bid No Bid 200.00$      4 x 1 gal No Bid

Indemnify (A) 1,650.00$  17.1 oz 6,600.00$  4 x 17.1 oz 1,650.00$  17.1 oz 1,650.00$  17.1 oz

54.09$        box 248.00$      24 x 5.25 oz case 280.99$      24 x 5.25 oz case No Bid

228.00$      4 x 1 gal
Jet Black Pond Dye

10-2-8 Nature safe

Meridian (A)

Vivax


