
PG Equipment Sheffield/Canterbury Park Place

1/26/16

Play & Park Structures of 

Norther IL 4516 21st Ave 

Moline, IL 61265  309-339-

0536 

ppuebla@playandpark.co

m

Zenon Company  400 W. 

Dundee Rd, Ste 110, buffalo 

Grove, IL 60089  847-548-

1143 

larry@zenoncompany.com

Play Illinois 4716 Roslyn 

Downers Grove, IL 60515 

630-514-5405  

Mike@PlayIL.Today

Parkreation, Inc. 27 E. Palatine 

Rd, Prospect Heights, IL 60070 

847-419-7744 

john@parkreation.com

SHEFFIELD 

1a. 2-5 yr $6,621.29 $7,565.00 $7,825.00 $5,631.00

1b. 5-12 $32,880.67 $27,895.00 $45,216.00 $34,155.00
1c. 3bay 2 bucket swing $3,862.70 $4,653.00 $3,102.00 $3,261.00

1d. Spinner $525.00 $875.00 $646.00 $580.00

Freight $3,864.44

SHEF TOTAL $47,754.10 $37,719.00 $56,789.00 $42,282.00

Shef Alt 1 $2,822.00 no bid $1,865.00 $2,232.00

Shef Alt 2 $3,037.00 no bid $1,230.00 $2,532.00

Shef Alt 3 $3,732.00 no bid $1,608.00 $2,525.00

Freight $900.00

SH Total + alt $10,491.00 save $820 for all 3

CANTERBURY

2a. 2-5 yr $5,860.21 $6,246.00 $7,445.00 $5,631.00

2b. 5-12 yr $42,956.50 $32,780.00 $35,807.00 $48,666.00

2c. Spinner $525.00 $857.00 $646.00 $580.00

Freight $4,378.42

CANT TOTAL $53,720.13 $38,590.00 $43,898.00 $54,674.00

Cant Alt 1 $2,472.85 $4,559.00 $3,130.00 $3,475.00

Cant Alt 2 $1,531.40 $2,089.00 $1,278.00 $1,412.00

Total delivered cost 

1a,b,c,d + 2a,b,c + Alt 1+2 $104,478.48 $75,300.00 $76,870.00 $100,134.00



PG Equipment Sheffield/Canterbury Park Place

1/26/16

Reese Recreation, 3327 N. 

Ridge Arlington Hts, IL 885-

206-4861 

skoch@reeserec.com

GameTime c/o Cunningham 

Rec 2135 city Gate Lane Ste 

300, Naperville, IL 60563  800-

942-1062 

doug@cunninghamrec.com

SHEFFIELD 

1a. 2-5 yr $6,903.00 $5,500.53

1b. 5-12 $37,580.00 $32,626.92

1c. 3bay 2 bucket swing $2,955.00 $3,506.69

1d. Spinner $742.00 $729.47

Freight

SHEF TOTAL $48,180.00 $41,999.86

Shef Alt 1 no bid $3,488.71

Shef Alt 2 no bid $3,976.39

Shef Alt 3 no bid $4,484.48

Freight

SH Total + alt

CANTERBURY

2a. 2-5 yr $5,185.00 $5,500.53

2b. 5-12 yr $43,458.00 $39,769.57

2c. Spinner $742.00 $729.47

Freight

CANT TOTAL $49,385.00 $46,999.57

Cant Alt 1 $3,101.50 $3,951.18

Cant Alt 2 $1,311.30 $1,616.93

Total delivered cost 

1a,b,c,d + 2a,b,c + Alt 1+2 $94,767.00 $91,175.24


